GREENFIELD WATER UTILITY

451 Meek Street

Greenfield, Indiana 46140
www.greenfieldin.or

Phone: (317) 477-4350

11 March 2024

Mayor Guy Titus

Board of Works and Public Safety
10 South State St.

Greenfield, IN 46140

Re: Chlorine supplies contractual election 2" Quarter - Informational
Mayor and Board Members,

As per our contract with Brenntag Mid-South INC., an email has been provided to the
Water Utility that as of the date of the email notice as of 28 February 2025 Brenntag is locking in
the current price per pound of Chlorine gas at $1.19. As this is the best pricing available, | am
advising that the Utility will continue to order from Brenntag Mid-South, INC. for 2" Quarter
ending 30 June 2025. Prior to the end of the 2nd quarter of 2025, we will request updated
pricing for service from all distributors and make the selection for service for 3" Quarter ending
30 September 2025. We will provide another award letter at the time of selection for the 2"
Quarter to ensure that all parties acknowledge any change that may be selected.

The following is the tabulation of the pricing as received:

Company Cost per pound | Pricing firm
of chlorine through
Brenntag Mid-South Inc. $1.19 30 June 2025
Water Solutions Unlimited | $1.38 30 June 2025
Alexander Chemical Corp $1.43 30 June 2025

I am advising the Board that we continue with Brenntag Mid-South INC. for chlorine supply
services for 2" Quarter ending on 30 June 2025.

I welcome any questions the Board may have on this recommendation.

Respectfully Submitted,

/%/
Charles Gill

Water Utility Manager cc: Jane Webb, Utility Coordinator
Gregg Morelock, City Attorney
Lori EImore, Clerk-Treasurer


http://www.greenfieldin.org/

3/6/25, 9:19 AM Zimbra

Zimbra cgill@greenfieldin.org

FW: 2nd Quarter Pricing

From : Sara W. Terry/Mid-South/Brenntag Mon, Mar 03, 2025 02:59 PM
<Sara.Terry@brenntag.com> 2 2 attachments

Subject : FW: 2nd Quarter Pricing
To : Jimmy Griffith <jgriffith@greenfieldin.org>
Cc : Charles Gill <cgill@greenfieldin.org>

Allow sender | Block sender |
Report

Caution! This message was sent from outside the City of Greenfield.

Hello Jimmy —
Pricing will remain firm through Q2.

Product : Chlorine 150's
Product # : 873311
Price: $1.19 Ib

Thank you,
Sara

Sara Terry
Municipal Bid Manager
Brenntag Essentials North America Midsouth

5 BRENNTAG

Brenntag Mid-South, Inc.
1333 Virginia St SW

Lenoir, North Carolina 28645
United States of America

Phone: 828-729-7557
E-Mail: Sara.Terry@brenntag.com
www.brenntag.com

LinkedIn - Facebook - X - YouTube

NOTICE OF CONFIDENTIAL/PRIVILEGED COMMUNICATION:

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged information and are only for the use of the
intended recipient of this message. If you are not an intended recipient, any unauthorized use, review, dissemination, or copying by you is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you believe you have received this or any other electronic communication in error, please notify the sender by replying to the
communication, and then delete it and all accompanying attachments from your system.

DISCLAIMER:

Brenntag North America, Inc. and all of its affiliates and subsidiaries (“Brenntag”) expressly disclaim the formation of any contract via email.
Any agreement with Brenntag must be confirmed in writing with authorized signatures to be considered valid.
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February 28, 2025

Greenfield Water Utility
451 Meek St.
Greenfield, IN 46140

Price for Chlorine 2™ Qtr. 2025

Pricing for 2" Quarter 2025 for 150 Ib chlorine cylinders for City of Greenfield will be

$1.38 Ib- same as last quarter

Thank you and we look forward to working with you again

Mike Ricks
President
Water Solutions Unlimited, Inc.
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8824 Union Mills Drive

‘K — Camby IN 46113




3/6/25, 9:17 AM Zimbra

Zimbra

RE: 2nd Quarter Pricing

From : Haney, Cheyenne <Cheyenne.haney@alexchem.com>
Subject : RE: 2nd Quarter Pricing
To : Jimmy Griffith <jgriffith@greenfieldin.org>
Cc : Charles Gill <cgill@greenfieldin.org>

Caution! This message was sent from outside the City of Greenfield.

Hi Jimmy,

cgill@greenfieldin.org

Mon, Mar 03, 2025 09:51 AM
# 2 attachments

Allow sender | Block sender |
Report

I just heard back, and we are staying at $1.433/Ib. However, if you are going to place an order, we

need ample time to set you up as a customer and such.
Please let us know beforehand if you would like to order.
Thank you!

Regards,

Cheyenne Haney

Inside Sales & Bid Specialist
7593 S. First Road

LaPorte, IN 46350

Office: (219) 402-0592

Fax: (219) 393-5364
www.alexanderchemical.com

CELEBRATING

YEARS

From: Haney, Cheyenne
Sent: Friday, February 28, 2025 1:42 PM
To: Jimmy Griffith <jgriffith@greenfieldin.org>
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