Zimbra rsouchon@greenfieldin.org

Fwd: Parker Sub Feeder Exits - Phase 3 Labor Approval

From : Scott Yost <syost@greenfieldin.org> Wed, Nov 29, 2023 12:35 PM
Subject : Fwd: Parker Sub Feeder Exits - Phase 3 Labor Approval
To : Robert Souchon <rsouchon@greenfieldin.org>

Rob,

Bill Castrodale sent the email below explaining your portion of phase 3 (Pennsy Trail)...$27,800.00. I'm
not sure what the process would be for the encumbrance since we're paying for it, if you're planning on
doing that of course. Hopefully Lori will be able to work something out.

Have a great day!

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Scott Yost <syost@greenfieldin.org>

Date: November 29, 2023 at 12:21:17PM EST

To: Bill Castrodale <billyc@impa.com>

Subject: Re: Parker Sub Feeder Exits - Phase 3 Labor Approval

Thank you Billy! I greatly appreciate it.

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 29, 2023, at 10:21 AM, Bill Castrodale <billyc@impa.com> wrote:

I This sender is trusted.




Scott,

Thanks for sending this over, we will get our PO over to Mill Drill ASAP. By the
quote they sent us I have the following cost estimates for installing the fiber
portion of this phase of the project:

Install Fiber Hand Hole Pull Boxes $5,200
Directional Bore (2) 1 4" Conduits $18,980
Install Fiber Cable $3,620

Total Cost Estimate $27,800

Let me know if you have any questions or need anything else from us.

Thanks,

Bill Castrodale

Senior Project Engineer

IMPA Service Corp

A: 11610 N. College Ave., Carmel, IN 46032

P:317-575-3869 | \: 317-726-7261

E: billyc@impa.com | w: www.impa.com
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From: Scott Yost <syost@greenfieldin.org>

Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2023 12:08 PM

To: Bill Castrodale <billyc@impa.com>

Subject: Parker Sub Feeder Exits - Phase 3 Labor Approval

Bill,

The attachment above contains the signed approval letter for the Parker Sub. phase 3
labor. Also, would it be possible to get the cost for I.T.'s portion? They are going to help
pay for phase 3, and wanted to know what their portion would be of the total amount.
Any help would be greatly appreciated!

Thank you and have a great day!

Scott Yost
Electric Utility Manager
Greenfield Power & Light

Office: 317-477-4370
Cell: 317-538-3855
syost@greenfieldin.org

"You can't climb the ladder of success with your hands in your pockets."



